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,;fdaprafloll 
Adaptation is a game show of life. Phil Benson, a child of a 
child of a liberal Protestant middle class family is set forth on 
the journey of life upon the treacherous game board. Phil must 
gain access to the super bonus card that holds contentment, but 
the harder Phil tries to obtain success the more he must 
compromise himself, such is life he assumes. Join us on Phil's 
journey, from infancy to death; will he win? Mark Gavartin & 
Ken Ruda 

Sorry. Wrof1g..JVumber 
Lucille fletcher wrote Sorry. Wrong Numher in 1948. It was 
originally written as a radio play, and then later made into a 
movie. The stage version is what you will see tonight. 
Sorry, Wrong Number is more than a superb hair-raising 
episode about a useless neurotic woman. With dramatic force 
it shows how we can rely too much on a mechanical crutch for 
maintaining contact with people. This play is an unforgettable 
classic with a shrewish heroine and comical operators. Enjoy! 
Amit Shaham 

Trifles 
Local fanner John Wright has been killed and his wife is being 
held on suspicion of murder. Trifles begins back at the scene 
of the crime. The County Attorney, Sheriff, and neighboring 
fanner are searching for clues that might point to motive. The 
wives of the latter two join the men to gather clothes for the 
suspect, but along the way stumble across much, much more. 
It has been a pleasure working on such a great piece of writing 
and with such a wonderful cast. Enjoy the show ... 
Becca & Penelope 



3rd (lfL"--U?Uf.. 
When you take a look around you what do you see? j'J and 
Love takes a closer look at the masks people wear everyday in 
order to hide their true selves and fit into a niche. We truly 
believe that nil everyone wants in life is love. We have had the 
opportunity to watch a wonderful and diverse cast grow and 
help us grow not only as directors, but also as people. Our 
thanks go out to Jim for his guidance, great ideas and never 
ending support. We'd like to both thank our Mom, Dad and 
Scott and Jeff for their hi-polarization and Chris for her 
sarcasm. Lil' Bears for their cuddles and kisses and all the 
crazy people we've met on this road we lovingly call life, with 
love from us ... to you. 

Eric Gray & Sonia Marie Castanier Class of 1999 

CalULCloveL 
In choosing this play we confronted such issues as 
disappointment, lost and simple dreams, manipulation and 
power. The tomato represents people's inability to deaJ with 
life's disappointments ... Just as Eddie tries to explain to 
Sandy thai his dreams are valid, we hope this disturbing 
exploration of the effects of powerlessness can be as 
challenging and gratifying for you as it has been for us. We 
appreciate your joining us on thisjoumey. 

Kara Blitz, Karen Bein, and the cast 
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